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Visure Requirements 4.8 is Available Now!! 

 
 

This new release includes features for improved usability, functionality and 
performance.  

 
 
San Francisco, Feb 9, 2015 – Visure Solutions, the market leader in Requirements Lifecycle 
Management, is pleased to announce the release of Visure Requirements 4.8. This new version 
includes features for improved usability, functionality and performance. 
 
Users can now create and edit information in Visure Requirements faster, reducing the number 
of interactions with the tool for several tasks; at the same time, those interactions have also 
become more user-friendly, so that users can now be more productive in one of the main 
activity areas in the tool. Users can more easily create links, through the new drag & drop link 
creation functionality.  
 
They can search for text in items faster and replace with new text, through the new Search and 
Replace tool. Also, with a redesigned multi-item attribute edit tool, users can more easily modify 
attribute values for a selection of items, which can help in activities such as establishing initial 
values for selection of items, or reconfiguring attribute values after copying information. 
 
Information browsing and analysis have also become much easier and faster with Visure 
Requirements 4.8. View creation and editing has been reviewed, so that the functionality is now 
more at hand, with the new column title context menu and the new configuration dialogs. As a 
result, users can now create or modify views faster, increasing the value of the functionality that 
can now be used even for small tasks. View creation and modification is now more evident to all 
users, not just tool specialists. 
 
Visure Requirements 4.8 greatly helps users perform traceability analysis, increasing the 
number of questions that can be answered with the tool. Through the improved links filter 
capabilities, users can now more easily respond to questions such as “Which of my 
requirements are not currently linked to tests” or “which of my requirements are gold plating, 
since they are not traced to higher level requirements”. The new filter capabilities enable users 
to very easily obtain a list of items that have or don’t have a specific type of link associated. 
 
Finally, Visure Solutions in its continued effort to improve tool performance, has put in Visure 
Requirements 4.8 special attention to this aspect in low bandwidth environments, where 
performance has been increased by up to 50% in some functionalities in these environments. 
This performance increase may also benefit users in other network environments, who should 
perceive noticeable increases in user responsiveness in some areas, like project opening. 
 
Visure Solutions continues to listen to users and to work on improvements in the tool suite, in 
order to provide best in class solutions for requirements management needs from companies 
around the globe.  
 
Baldo Rincón, our COO says "With this new release, Visure Requirements users can perform 
requirements management activities easier, quicker and simpler so that their organizations are 
capable to accomplish their projects more efficiently" 
 

For more information, please visit www.visuresolutions.com/whats-new 
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About Visure Solutions 
 
Visure Solutions is the market leader in Requirements Definition and Management. Through its 
Requirements Lifecycle Management platform, Visure offers powerful and innovative solutions 
that enable its customers to develop the highest quality products, systems, and services. Visure 
Requirements' quality, state-of-the-art features, and benefits are endorsed by the world's 
leading organizations.  
 
Visure's team has a unique and profound experience in the development and implementation of 
requirements solutions.  
 
 
Visure Solutions, Inc. is headquartered in San Francisco with branch offices in Spain, United 
Kingdom, and Germany. Visure has leading distributors worldwide in Austria, Benelux, Brazil, 
Canada, China, France, Italy, India, Mexico, Portugal, and Scandinavia. For more information, 
please visit www.visuresolutions.com 
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